
Mishpatim Torah Reading for 5785/2025

Torah Portion for Mishpatim:  Exodus 21:1-25

1. And these are the judgments which you shall
set before them.

2. If you buy a Hebrew servant, six years he
shall serve; and in the seventh he shall go out
free, for nothing.

3. If he came in by himself, he shall go out by
himself; if he was married, then his wife shall
go out with him.

4. If his master has given him a wife, and she
has born him sons or daughters; the wife and
her children shall be her master’s, and he shall
go out by himself.

5. And if the servant shall plainly say, I love my
master, my wife, and my children; I will not go
out free;

6. Then his master shall bring him to the judges;
he shall also bring him to the door, or to the
door post; and his master shall bore his ear
through with an awl; and he shall serve him
forever.

7. And if a man sells his daughter to be a
maidservant, she shall not go out as the
menservants do.

8. If she pleases not her master, who has
designated her for himself, then shall he let her
be redeemed; to sell her to a strange nation he
shall have no power, seeing he has dealt
deceitfully with her.

9. And if he has betrothed her to his son, he
shall deal with her as with a daughter.

10. If he takes for himself another wife; her
food, her garment, and her duty of marriage,
shall he not diminish.

11. And if he does not do these three things to
her, then shall she go out free without
payment of money.



12. He who strikes a man, so that he dies, shall
be surely put to death.

13. And if a man lies not in wait, but God
delivers him into his hand; then I will appoint
you a place where he shall flee.

14. But if a man comes wilfully upon his
neighbor, to slay him treacherously; you shall
take him from my altar, that he may die.

15. And he who strikes his father, or his
mother, shall be surely put to death.

16. And he who steals a man, and sells him, or if
he is found in his hand, he shall surely be put to
death.

17. And he who curses his father, or his
mother, shall surely be put to death.

18. And if men quarrel together, and one
strikes another with a stone, or with his fist,
and he dies not, but keeps to his bed;

19. If he rises again, and walks out with his
staff, then shall he who struck him be
acquitted; only he shall pay for the loss of his
time, and shall cause him to be thoroughly
healed.

20. And if a man strikes his servant, or his maid,
with a rod, and he dies under his hand; he shall
be surely punished.

21. However, if he survives a day or two, he
shall not be punished, for he is his money.

22. If men quarrel, and hurt a pregnant woman,
so that her fruit depart from her, and yet no
further harm follows; he shall be surely
punished, according to what the woman’s
husband will lay upon him; and he shall pay as
the judges determine.

23. And if any further harm follows, then you
shall give life for life,

24. Eye for eye, tooth for tooth, hand for hand,
foot for foot,

25. Burning for burning, wound for wound,
bruise for bruise.



Mishpatim Haftarah Reading for 5785/2025

Haftarah for Mishpatim:   Jeremiah 34:8-22    and    33:25-26

Chapter 34

8. This is the word that came to Jeremiah from
the Lord, after the king Zedekiah had made a
covenant with all the people who were in
Jerusalem, to proclaim liberty to them;

9. That every man should let his Hebrew male
slave, and every man his Hebrew female slave,
go free; that none should enslave any of them,
namely, a man of Judah, being his brother.

10. Now when all the princes, and all the
people, who had entered into the covenant,
heard that every one should let his male slave,
and every one his female slave, go free, that
none should enslave them any more, then they
obeyed, and let them go.

11. But afterward they relapsed, and caused
the male slaves, and the female slaves, whom
they had let go free, to return, and brought
them into subjection as slaves.

12. Therefore the word of the Lord came to
Jeremiah from the Lord, saying,

13. Thus says the Lord, the God of Israel; I
made a covenant with your fathers in the day
that I brought them forth out of the land of
Egypt, out of the house of slaves, saying,

14. At the end of seven years set free every
man his Hebrew brother, who has been sold to
you; and when he has served you six years, you
shall let him go free from you; but your fathers
did not listen to me, nor inclined their ear.



15. And you now turned, and have done right
in my sight, in proclaiming liberty every man to
his neighbor; and you have made a covenant
before me in the house which is called by my
name;

16. But you turned and polluted my name, and
caused every man his male slave, and every
man his female slave, whom he had set free
according to their desire, to return, and
brought them into subjection, to be your
slaves.

17. Therefore thus says the Lord; Since you
have not listened to me, in proclaiming liberty,
every one to his brother, and every man to his
neighbor; behold, I proclaim a liberty for you,
says the Lord, to the sword, to the pestilence,
and to the famine; and I will make you a horror
to all the kingdoms of the earth.

18. And I will give the men who have
transgressed my covenant, which have not
kept the words of the covenant which they had
made before me, when they cut the calf in two,
and passed between its parts.

19. The princes of Judah, and the princes of
Jerusalem, the eunuchs, and the priests, and all
the people of the land, who passed between
the parts of the calf;

20. I will give them to the hand of their
enemies, and to the hand of those who seek
their life; and their dead bodies shall be food
for the birds of the heaven, and for the beasts
of the earth.

21. And Zedekiah king of Judah and his princes
will I give to the hand of their enemies, and to
the hand of those who seek their life, and to
the hand of the king of Babylon’s army, which
are gone up from you.

22. Behold, I will command, says the Lord, and
cause them to return to this city; and they shall
fight against it, and take it, and burn it with
fire; and I will make the cities of Judah a
desolation without inhabitant.



Chapter 33

25. Thus says the Lord; If my covenant is not
established with day and night, and if I have
not appointed the ordinances of heaven and
earth;

26. Then will I cast away the seed of Jacob, and
David my servant, and not take any of his seed
to be rulers over the seed of Abraham, Isaac,
and Jacob; for I will cause their captivity to
return, and have mercy on them.


