
Pesach First Morning Torah Reading

First Torah Portion:  Exodus 12:37-51

37. The people of Israel journeyed from
Rameses to Succoth, about six hundred
thousand on foot, who were men, beside
children.

38. And a mixed multitude went up also with
them; and flocks, and herds, and very many
cattle.

39. And they baked unleavened cakes of the
dough which they brought forth out of Egypt,
for it was not leavened; because they were
thrust out of Egypt, and could not remain,
neither had they prepared for themselves any
provision.

40. Now the sojourning of the people of
Israel, who dwelt in Egypt, was four hundred
and thirty years.

41. And it came to pass at the end of the four
hundred and thirty years, even on that very
day it came to pass, that all the hosts of the
Eternal went out from the land of Egypt.

42. It is a night of watchfulness to the Eternal
for bringing them out of the land of Egypt.
This is a night of watching kept to the Eternal
by all the people of Israel throughout their
generations.

43. And the Eternal said to Moses and Aaron,
This is the ordinance of the Passover; No
stranger shall eat of it;

44. But every man’s servant who is bought
for money, when you have circumcised him,
then shall he eat of it.

45. A foreigner and a hired servant shall not
eat of it.

46. In one house shall it be eaten; you shall
not carry anything of the meat out of the
house; neither shall you break a bone of it.



47. All the congregation of Israel shall keep it.

48. And when a stranger shall sojourn with
you, and will keep the Passover to the
Eternal, let all his males be circumcised, and
then let him come near and keep it; and he
shall be as one who is born in the land; for no
uncircumcised person shall eat of it.

49. One law shall be for him who is native
born, and for the stranger who sojourns
among you.

50. Thus did all the people of Israel; as the
Eternal commanded Moses and Aaron, so did
they.

51. And it came to pass the same day, that
the Eternal did bring the people of Israel out
of the land of Egypt by their armies.

Second Torah Portion: Deuteronomy 8:10-18

10. When you have eaten and are satisfied,
then you shall bless the Eternal your God for
the good land which he has given you.

11. Beware that you forget not the Eternal
your God, in not keeping his commandments,
and his judgments, and his statutes, which I
command you this day;

12. Lest when you have eaten and are full,
and have built goodly houses, and lived there;

13. And when your herds and your flocks
multiply, and your silver and your gold is
multiplied, and all that you have is multiplied;

14. Then your heart be lifted up, and you
forget the Eternal your God, which brought
you out of the land of Egypt, from the house
of slavery;

15. Who led you through that great and
terrible wilderness, where were venomous
serpents, and scorpions, and drought, where
there was no water; who brought you water
out of the rock of flint;



16. Who fed you in the wilderness with
manna, which your fathers knew not, that he
might humble you, and that he might test
you, to do you good in the end;

17. And you say in your heart, My power and
the might of my hand has gotten me this
wealth.

18. And you shall remember the Eternal your
God; for he is who gives you power to get
wealth, that he may establish his covenant
which he swore to your fathers, as it is this
day.



Pesach First Morning Haftarah Reading

Haftarah for Pesach First Morning:   Ezekiel 37:1-14

1. The hand of the Eternal was upon me, and
carried me out in the wind of the Eternal, and
set me down in the midst of the valley which
was full of bones,

2. And he led me around among them; and,
behold, there were very many in the open
valley; and, behold, they were very dry.

3. And he said to me, Son of man, can these
bones live? And I answered, O Eternal God,
you know.

4. And he said to me, Prophesy over these
bones, and say to them, O you dry bones,
hear the word of the Eternal.

5. Thus says the Eternal God to these bones;
Behold, I will cause breath to enter into you,
and you shall live;

6. And I will lay sinews upon you, and will
bring up flesh upon you, and cover you with
skin, and put breath in you, and you shall live;
and you shall know that I am the Eternal.

7. And I prophesied as I was commanded; and
as I prophesied, there was a noise, and
behold a shaking, and the bones came
together, bone to its bone.

8. And as I beheld, behold, the sinews and the
flesh came up upon them, and the skin
covered them above; but there was no
breath in them.

9. And he said to me, Prophesy to the breath,
prophesy, son of man, and say to the breath,
Thus says the Eternal God: Come from the
four winds, O breath, and breathe upon these
slain, that they may live.



10. And I prophesied as he commanded me,
and the breath came into them, and they
lived, and stood up upon their feet, a very
large army.

11. Then he said to me, son of man, these
bones are the whole house of Israel; behold,
they say, Our bones are dried, and our hope is
lost; we are clean cut off.

12. Therefore prophesy and say to them,
Thus says the Eternal God: Behold, O my
people, I will open your graves, and cause
you to come up out of your graves, and bring
you into the land of Israel.

13. And you shall know that I am the Eternal,
when I have opened your graves, O my
people, and brought you up from your
graves,

14. And I shall put my spirit in you, and you
shall live, and I shall place you in your own
land; then shall you know that I, the Eternal,
have spoken it, and performed it, says the
Eternal.


